
Albany County Request for Contract Approval

Contract # 2022-723

Contract Type B) CAB Contract

Contract Action A) New

Contract Action Type N) None

Department A1010 - LegislatureA1230 - County Executive

Date Submitted Thursday, December 15, 2022

Contact Person Ford, Eric

Contact Phone  () -518

Vendor Info Capital Roots 
594 River Street, Troy, NY 12180

Estimated Amount $35,000.00

Estimated Term 12/15/2022  to  12/31/2023

Scope of Services Capital Roots, a registered 501(c)(3) organization based in Troy, NY, is 
committed to a food donation initiative called Squash Hunger. The initiative 
collects and distributes more than 40 tons of fresh produce to the Capital 
Region’s food pantries and shelters each year.  The organization has 
requested monetary assistance so that it may better serve the community. 
Together, the County Executive and the County Legislature are requesting 
that $35,000 be provided to Capital Roots, so that they may expand their 
presence and help those in need. Heres a link to their website.
https://www.capitalroots.org/squash-hunger/

Budget Line Item AA1010 - 44015      AA1310 - 44046      -       - 

Fiscal Impact County: 100.00%  State: 0.00%  Federal: 0.00%
Local: 0.00%  Other: 0.00%

BID, RFP, RFQ Completed? N/A

Budget Analyst Date

For Contract Board Use: Date Approved

Daniel P. McCoy
Albany County Executive

Andrew Joyce, Chairman
Albany County Legislature

Bruce A. Hidley
Albany County Clerk





















Albany County Request for Contract Approval

Contract # 2022-685

Contract Type B) CAB Contract

Contract Action A) New

Contract Action Type N) None

Department A3150 - Correctional Facility

Date Submitted Tuesday, December 06, 2022

Contact Person Lyons, Michael

Contact Phone  () -

Vendor Info Bob Barker Company, Inc.
7925 Purfoy Road , Fuquay Varina, North Carolina  27526

Estimated Amount $23,000.00

Estimated Term 12/1/2022  to  11/30/2023

Scope of Services Purchase Inmate Clothing at the Albany County Correctional Facility.

Budget Line Item AA3150 - 44201       -       -       - 

Fiscal Impact County: 100.00%  State: 0.00%  Federal: 0.00%
Local: 0.00%  Other: 0.00%

BID, RFP, RFQ Completed? Yes - BID

Budget Analyst Date

For Contract Board Use: Date Approved

Daniel P. McCoy
Albany County Executive

Andrew Joyce, Chairman
Albany County Legislature

Bruce A. Hidley
Albany County Clerk
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Item #1:   Work Shirts, V Neck, Striped Fabric
Required Lead Time:  21 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

Small 75.20$      30-95 days No Bid

Medium 75.20$      30-95 days No Bid

Large 75.20$      30-95 days No Bid

X-Large 75.20$      30-95 days No Bid

2X-Large 75.20$      30-95 days No Bid

3X-Large 81.78$      30-95 days No Bid

4X-Large 85.30$      30-95 days No Bid

5X-Large 85.30$      30-95 days No Bid

6X-Large 89.58$      30-95 days No Bid

8X-Large 89.58$      30-95 days No Bid

RFB #2022-120:   Inmate Clothing and Sheets
Albany County Correctional Facility
Bid Tabulation

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA
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Item #2A:   Work Pants, Slip-On, Solid Fabric
Required Lead Time:  21 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

Small  $     94.68 7-30 BD 75.00$      

Medium  $     94.68 7-30 BD 75.00$      

Large  $     94.68 7-30 BD 75.00$      

X-Large  $     94.68 7-30 BD 75.00$      

2X-Large  $     94.68 7-30 BD 78.00$      

3X-Large  $     99.72 7-30 BD 80.00$      

4X-Large  $   104.76 7-30 BD 84.00$      

5X-Large  $   107.76 7-30 BD 88.00$      

6X-Large  $   109.32 7-30 BD 92.00$      

8X-Large  $   143.40 7-30 BD 96.00$      

Bob Barker Co. Mimi Wing, USA



3

Item #2B:   Work Pants, Slip-On, Striped Fabric
Required Lead Time:  21 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

Small  $     94.68 7-30 BD  No Bid 

Medium 94.68$      7-30 BD No Bid

Large 94.68$      7-30 BD No Bid

X-Large 94.68$      7-30 BD No Bid

2X-Large 94.68$      7-30 BD No Bid

3X-Large 99.72$      7-30 BD No Bid

4X-Large 104.76$    7-30 BD No Bid

5X-Large 107.76$    7-30 BD No Bid

6X-Large 109.32$    7-30 BD No Bid

8X-Large 143.40$    7-30 BD No Bid

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA
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Item #3:   Gym T-Shirts
Required Lead Time:  21 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

Small 48.60$      7-30 BD 43.00$      

Medium 48.60$      7-30 BD 43.00$      

Large 48.60$      7-30 BD 43.00$      

X-Large 48.60$      7-30 BD 43.00$      

2X-Large 79.80$      7-30 BD 65.00$      

3X-Large 97.80$      7-30 BD 77.00$      

4X-Large 97.80$      7-30 BD 79.00$      

5X-Large 97.80$      7-30 BD 82.00$      

6X-Large No Bid No Bid

8X-Large No Bid No Bid

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA



5

Item #4:   EVA Step-In Shoe, With Ventilation Holes
Required Lead Time:  21 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

Small (5/6) 51.60$      7-30 BD 39.00$      
Medium 
(7/8) 51.60$      7-30 BD 39.00$      
Large 
(9/10) 51.60$      7-30 BD 39.00$      

XL (11/12) 51.60$      7-30 BD 39.00$      

2XL (13/14) 51.60$      7-30 BD 39.00$      

3XL (15/16) 51.60$      7-30 BD 39.00$      

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA



6

Item #5:   Coveralls, Solid Fabric
Required Lead Time:  21 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

Small 185.52$    7-30 BD No Bid

Medium 185.52$    7-30 BD No Bid

Large 185.52$    7-30 BD No Bid

X-Large 185.52$    7-30 BD No Bid

2X-Large 185.52$    7-30 BD No Bid

3X-Large 200.64$    7-30 BD No Bid

4X-Large 212.76$    7-30 BD No Bid

5X-Large 224.40$    7-30 BD No Bid

6X-Large 234.60$    7-30 BD No Bid

8X-Large 261.36$    7-30 BD No Bid

10X-Large 276.84$    7-30 BD No Bid

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA
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Item #6:   Men's Briefs
Required Lead Time:  14 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

Small 11.80$      7-30 BD No Bid

Medium 11.80$      7-30 BD No Bid

Large 12.19$      7-30 BD No Bid

X-Large 13.25$      7-30 BD No Bid

2X-Large 14.12$      7-30 BD No Bid

3X-Large 15.13$      7-30 BD No Bid

4X-Large 16.00$      7-30 BD No Bid

5X-Large 16.00$      7-30 BD No Bid

6X-Large 17.25$      7-30 BD No Bid

7X-Large 17.25$      7-30 BD No Bid

8X-Large 17.25$      7-30 BD No Bid

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA
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Item #7:   Women's Briefs
Required Lead Time:  14 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

Small 8.01$        7-30 BD No Bid

Medium 8.01$        7-30 BD No Bid

Large 9.71$        7-30 BD No Bid

X-Large 9.71$        7-30 BD No Bid

2X-Large 10.20$      7-30 BD No Bid

3X-Large 10.93$      7-30 BD No Bid

4X-Large 10.93$      7-30 BD No Bid

5X-Large 10.93$      7-30 BD No Bid

6X-Large 10.93$      7-30 BD No Bid

7X-Large 10.93$      7-30 BD No Bid

8X-Large 10.93$      7-30 BD No Bid

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA



9

Item #8:   Sports Bras
Required Lead Time:  14 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

Medium 20.50$      7-30 BD No Bid

Large 20.50$      7-30 BD No Bid

X-Large 20.50$      7-30 BD No Bid

2X-Large 20.50$      7-30 BD No Bid

3X-Large 20.50$      7-30 BD No Bid

4X-Large 20.50$      7-30 BD No Bid

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA
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Item #9:   Sweatshirts
Required Lead Time:  21 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

Small 82.32$      7-30 BD No Bid

Medium 82.32$      7-30 BD No Bid

Large 82.32$      7-30 BD No Bid

X-Large 82.32$      7-30 BD No Bid

2X-Large 86.16$      7-30 BD No Bid

3X-Large 86.16$      7-30 BD No Bid

4X-Large 91.92$      7-30 BD No Bid

5X-Large 91.92$      7-30 BD No Bid

6X-Large 97.80$      7-30 BD No Bid

7X-Large No Bid No Bid

8X-Large 104.28$    7-30 BD No Bid

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA
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Item #10:    Brown Sheets, 4.5 Oz. Poplin
Required Lead Time:  30 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

66" x 104" 51.25$      7-30 BD No Bid

Item #11:    Laundry Bags
Required Lead Time:  30 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

18" x 24" 24.60$      7-30 BD No Bid

Item #12:    Spit Socks
Required Lead Time:  30 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

18" x 24" 13.08$      7-30 BD No Bid

Item #13:    Watch Cap
Required Lead Time:  30 Days ARO

Vendor

Size
 Price Per 

Dozen 
 Lead 
Time

 Price Per 
Dozen Lead Time

One Size 14.85$      7-30 BD No Bid

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA

Bob Barker Co. Mini Wing, USA















































Albany County Request for Contract Approval

Contract # 2022-679

Contract Type B) CAB Contract

Contract Action C) Renewal

Contract Action Type

Department A4010 - Health

Date Submitted Friday, December 02, 2022

Contact Person Morin, Maegan

Contact Phone 1 (518) 447-4587

Vendor Info MVP
220 Alexander Street, Rochester, NY 14607-4002

Estimated Amount $75,000.00

Estimated Term 1/1/2023  to  12/31/2027

Scope of Services To process claims for clinic services to MVP Health Plan Inc and receipt 
revenue. 

Budget Line Item AA4010 -        -       -       - 

Fiscal Impact County: 0.00%  State: 0.00%  Federal: 0.00%
Local: 0.00%  Other: 0.00%

BID, RFP, RFQ Completed? N/A

Budget Analyst Date

For Contract Board Use: Date Approved

Daniel P. McCoy
Albany County Executive

Andrew Joyce, Chairman
Albany County Legislature

Bruce A. Hidley
Albany County Clerk



 

Albany County Department of Health is nationally accredited and meets rigorous public health  
standards set forth to best meet the needs of our community. 

 

 
 

 
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

COUNTY OF ALBANY 

175 GREEN STREET 
ALBANY, NEW YORK 12202 

 

The Dr. John J.A. Lyons 
ALBANY COUNTY HEALTH FACILITY 

(518) 447-4580     FAX (518) 447-4698 
 www.albanycounty.com 

 
  
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO:   Honorable Daniel P. McCoy, County Executive  

Honorable Bruce A. Hidley, County Clerk 
Honorable Andrew Joyce, Chairman, County Legislature 

 
FROM:  Elizabeth F. Whalen MD, MPH, Commissioner of Health 
 
DATE:  December 6, 2022 
                  
RE:   MVP  
 
 
Albany County DOH is requesting to renew our contract with MVP to act as an ancillary 
provider.  
 
As an MVP ancillary provider, ACDOH will be reimbursed for all clinic services provided to 
MVP insured individuals. This contract will be necessary to seek reimbursement through 
Medicaid, Medicare and Commercial Plans with MVP.  
 
If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to 
contact me directly at 447-4695. 
 
Thank you for your consideration of this request. 

 

DANIEL P. McCOY 
County Executive 

 
ELIZABETH F. WHALEN, MD, MPH 

Commissioner of Health 
 
 
 
 
 

 
   

 

MARIBETH MILLER, BSN, MS  
Assistant Commissioner for Public Health 

 
SHANNA F. WITHERSPOON, MPA 

Assistant Commissioner Finance and Administration 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
   







































































































Contract # 2022-681 

Contract Type B) CAB Contract

Contract Action A) New

Contract Action Type 

Department A4010 - Health 

Date Submitted Monday, December 05, 2022 

Contact Person Morin, Maegan 

Contact Phone 1 (518) 447-4587 

Vendor Info Richard F. Gullott, M.D. 
83 Baldwin Road, Schenectady, New York 12302 

Estimated Amount $99,999.00 

Estimated Term 1/1/2023 to 12/31/2025 

Scope of Services Contractor shall execute to entire work described in this contract which includes, but 
is not limited to: 

• Interpreting chest x-rays for tuberculosis evaluation, diagnosis, and
treatment;
• Evaluating and treating tuberculosis conditions
• Reviewing patient charts and chest x-rays,
• Ordering treatment and tests related to tuberculosis as needed.
• Indicating instructions for treatment follow-up to patient and to clinic staff;
• Providing patient education
• Providing consultation for mid-level providers on tuberculosis conditions,
• Maintaining certification to perform cardiopulmonary resuscitation (BLS)

Sessions of 3 hours minimum at a rate of $135 per hour or $405 per session. 

Budget Line Item AA4010 - 44046 - - -

Fiscal Impact County: 64.00% State: 36.00% Federal: 0.00% 
Local: 0.00% Other: 0.00% 

BID, RFP, RFQ Completed? N/A 

Budget Analyst Date 

For Contract Board Use: Date Approved 

Daniel P. McCoy Bruce A. Hidley     Andrew Joyce, Chairman 
 Albany County Executive  Albany County Clerk    Albany County Legislature 

Albany County Request for Contract Approval 



 

Albany County Department of Health is nationally accredited and meets rigorous public health  
standards set forth to best meet the needs of our community. 

 

 
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

COUNTY OF ALBANY 

175 GREEN STREET 
ALBANY, NEW YORK 12202 

 

The Dr. John J.A. Lyons 
ALBANY COUNTY HEALTH FACILITY 

(518) 447-4580     FAX (518) 447-4698 
 www.albanycounty.com 

 
  
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

 
 
TO:   Honorable Daniel P. McCoy, County Executive  

Honorable Bruce A. Hidley, County Clerk 
Honorable Andrew Joyce, Chairman, County Legislature 

 
FROM:  Elizabeth F. Whalen MD, MPH, Commissioner of Health 
 
DATE:  December 6, 2022 
                  
RE:   Dr. Richard Gullott  
 
 
Albany County DOH is requesting to contract with Dr. Richard Gullott for pulmonology services 
related to tuberculosis.  Dr. Gullott has been providing pulmonology services to the Health 
Department since 2007.  We are requesting a contract, amount not to exceed $99,999, with a 
term of January 1, 2023 to December 31, 2025.  
 
Dr. Gullott provides interpretation of chest x-rays for tuberculosis evaluation, orders treatment 
and tests related to tuberculosis as needed, indicates instructions for treatment follow-up to 
patients and clinic staff and provides patient education.  Fee is $135 per hour, an increase from 
$115 per hour in the prior contract.  Invoices for the last 3 year contract totaled $60,202. 
 
If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to 
contact me directly at 447-4695. 
 
Thank you for your consideration of this request. 
 

 

 
 

DANIEL P. McCOY 
County Executive 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
   

 

 
 

ELIZABETH F. WHALEN, MD, MPH 
Commissioner of Health 

 
 

MARIBETH MILLER, BSN, MS  
Assistant Commissioner for Public Health 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
   















































































Albany County Request for Contract Approval

Contract # 2022-725

Contract Type B) CAB Contract

Contract Action A) New

Contract Action Type SC) State Contract

Department D5010 - Public Works

Date Submitted Thursday, December 15, 2022

Contact Person Ramundo, Lisa

Contact Phone  () -518

Vendor Info DeNooyer Chevrolet, Inc.
127 Wolf Rd., Albany, NY 12205

Estimated Amount $54,547.20

Estimated Term 12/26/2022  to  2/26/2023

Scope of Services The Purchase of one 2023 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Crew Cab using NYS 
Mini Bid Contract #PC69048 Award 23166.

Bond HHYZ will be used for this purchase.
Budget Line Item AA1620 - HHYZ       -       -       - 

Fiscal Impact County: 100.00%  State: 0.00%  Federal: 0.00%
Local: 0.00%  Other: 0.00%

BID, RFP, RFQ Completed? N/A

Budget Analyst Date

For Contract Board Use: Date Approved

Daniel P. McCoy
Albany County Executive

Andrew Joyce, Chairman
Albany County Legislature

Bruce A. Hidley
Albany County Clerk











































































Contract# 

Contract Type 

Contract Action 

Contract Action Type 

Albany County Request for Contract Approval 

Department 

Date Submitted 

Contact Person 

Contact Phone 

Vendor Info 

Estimated Amount 

Estimated Term 

Scope of Services 

Budget Line Item 

Fiscal Impact 

BID, RFP, RFQ Completed? 

2022-678 

B) CAB Contract

B) Amendment

A 1620 - Building Services 

Friday, December 02, 2022 

Stover, Thomas 

1 (518) 447-3020 

Complete Perfection Construction, LLC (dba) Perfection Roofing 
705 S. Pearl St., Albany, NY 12202 

$33,975.00 

10/1/2022 to 9/30/2023 

Replace existing corrugated roofing system of the Waldman Lodge with new 
corrugated roofing system. 

AA 1620 - 4046 

County: 100.00% State: 0.00% Federal: 0.00% 

Local: 0.00% Other: 0.00% 

Yes - RFQ 

Budget Analyst Date 

For Contract Board Use: Date Approved 

Daniel P. McCoy 
Albany County Executive 

Bruce A. Hidley 
Albany County Clerk 

Andrew Joyce, Chairman 
Albany County Legislature 

























































Albany County Request for Contract Approval

Contract # 2022-718

Contract Type B) CAB Contract

Contract Action B) Amendment

Contract Action Type N) None

Department A1340 - Management & Budget

Date Submitted Wednesday, December 14, 2022

Contact Person Alderson, Patrick

Contact Phone 1 (518) 447-3033

Vendor Info Helgerson Solutions Group
150 State Street, Albany, New York 12207

Estimated Amount $74,500.00

Estimated Term 4/1/2022  to  5/31/2023

Scope of Services 1) Move forward with the narrow focus on understanding individual-level
utilization of services that would build towards development of unique
identifiers
2) Begin work with DMH and DSS first, to build a data map and prototype of
the infrastructure needed to access this information. Through these
prototyping, we will learn more about the infrastructure challenges to this
approach and potential issues as we move towards replication in other
departments
3) Begin working on care redesign pathways via Rapid Cycle Continuous
Improvement only after this prototype is complete.

Budget Line Item AA6070 - 44046      -  -      -

Fiscal Impact County: 100.00%  State: 0.00%  Federal: 0.00%
Local: 0.00%  Other: 0.00%

BID, RFP, RFQ Completed? Yes - RFP

Budget Analyst Date

For Contract Board Use: Date Approved

Daniel P. McCoy
Albany County Executive

Andrew Joyce, Chairman
Albany County Legislature

Bruce A. Hidley
Albany County Clerk



 

      
 
 
 
 

 
 

 
 

 
December 14, 2022 

 
 
            Hon. Daniel P. McCoy 
Albany County Executive 
112 State Street, Room 1200 
Albany, New York 12207 

 
Hon. Bruce A. Hidley 
Albany County Clerk 
16 Eagle Street, Room 128 
Albany, New York 12207 
 

 
Hon. Andrew Joyce, Chairman 
Albany County Legislature 
112 State Street, Room 710 
Albany, New York 12207 
 

  
 
Dear County Executive McCoy, Clerk Hidley, and Chairman Joyce: 
 
On behalf of the Department of Management & Budget, I am requesting authorization to amend a contract with 
Helgerson Solutions Group for a comprehensive assessment of current data infrastructure and protocols of 
Albany County Human Service departments. Under this contract, Helgerson Solutions is providing in depth 
analysis on the feasibility of designing a “single source of truth” information system, which could be used as a 
singular identification system to coordinate delivery of county services. 
 
The contract with Helgerson Solutions was originally for a term to begin April 1, 2022 through October 31, 2022. 
However, due to redesigning the project and narrowing the focus of the deliverables, the Department of 
Management and Budget is requesting a no cost extension through May 31, 2023.  The scope of work would be 
amended to: 1) Move forward with the narrow focus on understanding individual-level utilization of services that 
would build towards development of unique identifiers; 2) Begin work with DMH and DSS first, to build a data map 
and prototype of the infrastructure needed to access this information in a proof of concept fashion; and 3) Begin 
working on care redesign pathways via Rapid Cycle Continuous Improvement only after this prototype is 
complete. The overall cost will not exceed $74,500. 
 
Please don’t hesitate to contact me with any questions. 
 

Patrick Alderson 

Deputy Commissioner, Management & Budget 

DANIEL P. MCCOY 
COUNTY EXECUTIVE 

COUNTY OF ALBANY 
DEPARTMENT OF MANAGEMENT AND BUDGET 

112 STATE STREET, SUITE 1200 
ALBANY, NEW YORK 12207 

OFFICE: (518) 447-5525 
FAX: (518) 447-5589 

www.albanycounty.com 
 

       M. DAVID REILLY, JR 
        COMMISSIONER 

 
 
 

       PATRICK ALDERSON 
       DEPUTY COMMISSIONER 
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