
Albany County Request for Contract Approval

Contract # 2022-744

Contract Type B) CAB Contract

Contract Action A) New

Contract Action Type S) Sole Source (please attach sole source letter)

Department A3110 - Sheriff

Date Submitted Tuesday, December 27, 2022

Contact Person Miller, Doug

Contact Phone  () -518

Vendor Info FLOCK SAFETY
1170 HOWELL MILL ROAD NW, SUITE 210, ATLANTA, GA 30318

Estimated Amount $68,700.00

Estimated Term 1/1/2023  to  12/31/2023

Scope of Services WE WOULD LIKE TO PURCHASE 24 LICENSE PLATE READERS USING 
GRANT FUNDS ALREADY SECURED

Budget Line Item AA3110 - 22750.LET22       -       -       - 

Fiscal Impact County: 0.00%  State: 0.00%  Federal: 100.00%
Local: 0.00%  Other: 0.00%

BID, RFP, RFQ Completed? N/A

Budget Analyst Date

For Contract Board Use: Date Approved

Daniel P. McCoy
Albany County Executive

Andrew Joyce, Chairman
Albany County Legislature

Bruce A. Hidley
Albany County Clerk







































































































Albany County Request for Contract Approval

Contract # 2022-746

Contract Type B) CAB Contract

Contract Action A) New

Contract Action Type N) None

Department A4230 - Narcotic Addiction Control

Date Submitted Wednesday, December 28, 2022

Contact Person Gleason, Mark

Contact Phone 1 (518) 447-3014

Vendor Info Albany Diocesan School 
40 North Main Ave, Albany , NY  12203

Estimated Amount $45,305.00

Estimated Term 1/1/2023  to  12/31/2023

Scope of Services provides evidence based substance abuse prevention services to students 
attending Albany Catholic Schools. 

Budget Line Item AA4230 - 44999       -       -       - 

Fiscal Impact County: 0.00%  State: 100.00%  Federal: 0.00%
Local: 0.00%  Other: 0.00%

BID, RFP, RFQ Completed? N/A

Budget Analyst Date

For Contract Board Use: Date Approved

Daniel P. McCoy
Albany County Executive

Andrew Joyce, Chairman
Albany County Legislature

Bruce A. Hidley
Albany County Clerk





Daniel P. McCoy 
County Executive 

Daniel C. Lynch, Esq. 
Deputy County Executive 

COUNTY OF ALBANY 

DEPARTMENT OF MENTAL HEALTH 

175 GREEN STREET 

ALBANY, NEW YORK 12202 

518-447-4537 FAX 518-447-4577

WWW.ALBANYCOUNTY. COM

To: Honorable Daniel P. McCoy 
Honorable Bruce A. Hidley 
Honorable Andrew Joyce 

From: Stephen Giordano, Ph.D. 
Department of Mental Health 

Date: December 29, 2022 

Re: Contract Administration Request 
Contract #746 

Stephen J. Giordano, Ph.D. 
Director of Mental Health 

Cindy G. Hoffman, LCSW-R 
Deputy Director 

The Department of Mental Health requests consideration by the Contract Administration Board 
to enter into the following contract: 

Albany Diocesan School Board $45,305 #746 

The funding for this contract assists in providing students, teachers and parents the additional 
skills needed to avoid the use and abuse of addictive substances in Albany Diocesan Catholic 
schools. Funding goes to support the salary of a part time staff member that conducts two programs 
including the "Too Good for Violence" universal prevention program for grades K-8, and the "Too 
Good for Drugs and Violence" program which is used in grades 9-12. The programs are also involved 
in local coalition groups including Parents Who Host,_and Regional Underage Drinking and Drug Use 
Prevention. These programs are funded 100% by NYS Office of Alcoholism and Substance Abuse 
Services. 





Albany County Request for Contract Approval

Contract # 2022-693

Contract Type B) CAB Contract

Contract Action C) Renewal

Contract Action Type N) None

Department A1345 - Central Purchasing

Date Submitted Monday, December 12, 2022

Contact Person Nuvola, Alaina

Contact Phone 1 (518) 447-5545

Vendor Info Galls, LLC
1340 Russle Cave rd, Lexington , KY 40505

Estimated Amount $60,000.00

Estimated Term 1/11/2023  to  12/12/2024

Scope of Services Purchase Law Enforcement Supplies on an as-needed basis for
Various Albany County Agencies.

Budget Line Item AA3110 -       AA3510 -      AA3140 -       - 

Fiscal Impact County: 100.00%  State: 0.00%  Federal: 0.00%
Local: 0.00%  Other: 0.00%

BID, RFP, RFQ Completed? Yes - BID

Budget Analyst Date

For Contract Board Use: Date Approved

Daniel P. McCoy
Albany County Executive

Andrew Joyce, Chairman
Albany County Legislature

Bruce A. Hidley
Albany County Clerk





TEXT FOR FAX COVER SHEET: 

 

 

Your bid award for Bid #2020-121, Law Enforcement Equipment and Supplies for Various Albany County 

Facilities, is due to expire on January 12th 2023, however, the original bid terms and conditions provided for an 

optional one-year renewal period through January 12th 2024.  Please use the attached form to notify the 

Purchasing Agent if you are willing to extend your awarded bid prices through January 12th 2024.  Thank you 

for your prompt response. 



ALBANY COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES 
PURCHASING DIVISION  

112 STATE STREET, ROOM #1000 
ALBANY, NY  12207 

 
 

RE: BID #2020-121 
 Law Enforcement Equipment and Supplies  

 
 
 
 
 

PLEASE CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX BELOW: 
 
 

 I WISH TO RENEW BID #2020-121 AND WILL HOLD 
 AWARDED BID PRICES THROUGH JANUARY 12, 2024 
  
 I DO NOT WISH TO EXTEND CURRENT BID PRICES 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

SUBMITTED BY: 
 
 
VENDOR:           
 
REPRESENTATIVE:           
 
TELEPHONE #           
 
FAX #:           
 
SIGNATURE:           
 
 
 
 

PLEASE RETURN THIS FORM BY FAX OR EMAIL 
TO ALAINA NUVOLA @ 518-447-5588 OR ALAINA.NUVOLA@ALBANYCOUNTYNY.GOV  

 
 
 
 

Galls, LLC

Mike Fadden, CEO

800-876-4242

877-914-2557

mailto:ALAINA.NUVOLA@ALBANYCOUNTYNY.GOV
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COUNTY OF ALBANY 
REQUEST FOR BIDS 

GENERAL INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS 
 
 
 
BID DISTRIBUTION-  IMPORTANT NOTICE 
 
The County of Albany officially distributes bidding documents through the Purchasing Division 
Office or through the Empire State Bid System website at http://www.empirestatebidsystem.com.  
Copies of bidding documents obtained from any other source are not considered official documents.  
Only those vendors who obtain bidding documents from either the Purchasing Division Office or the 
Empire State Bid System are guaranteed to receive addendum information, if such information is 
issued.  
 
If you have obtained this document from a source other than the Albany County Purchasing Division 
or the Empire State Bid System, it is strongly recommended that you obtain an official copy. 
 
SECTION 1:  BID IDENTIFICATION 
 

1.1 Title: Law Enforcement Equipment and Supplies  
1.2 Requesting Department: Various Albany County Departments  
1.3 Bid Number: 2020-121 

 
SECTION 2:  PURPOSE 
 

2.1 The intent of these specifications is to furnish information to responsible bidders for the 
purpose of obtaining bids for Law Enforcement Equipment and Supplies as requested by 
various Albany County Departments.   

 
2.2 Minority Business Enterprises (MBE’s) and Women Business Enterprises (WBE’s) are 

encouraged to apply. 
 
SECTION 3:  BIDDING DOCUMENTS 
 

3.1 Complete sets of the Bidding Documents may be obtained or examined as stated in the Notice 
to Bidders. 

 
3.2 Complete sets of Bidding Documents must be used in preparing bids.  The County does not 

assume any responsibility for errors or misinterpretations resulting from the use of incomplete 
sets of Bidding Documents. 

 
SECTION 4:  SUBMISSION OF BIDS 
 

4.1 Bids and any other required documents must be submitted, sealed in an opaque envelope, 
plainly marked with the name and number of the bid and the name and address of the bidder 



GIB2 

and accompanied by the required documents.  Bids must be received no later than 11:00A.M. 
ON THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 12, 2020, at the following address: 
 
Karen A. Storm 
Albany County Purchasing Agent 
112 State Street, Room 1000   
Albany, NY   12207 

 
4.2 All bids received after the time stated in the “Notice to Bidders”, or the bid submission 

deadline as modified by formal addendum consistent with Section 14 of this Request for Bids, 
may not be considered and will be returned to the bidder. The bidder assumes the risk of any 
delay in the mail or in the handling of the mail by employees of Albany County. Whether sent 
by mail or by means of personal delivery, the bidder assumes responsibility for having his bid 
deposited on time at the place specified. 

 
4.3 Albany County reserves the right to reject any or all bids in whole or in part, to waive any and 

all informalities, and to disregard all non-conforming, non-responsive or conditional bids. 
 
SECTION 5:  TERM OF BID 
 

5.1 The bid shall be for the period of one (1) year from the date of award to date ending with the 
anticipated dates January 10, 2020- January 11, 2021.  Prices shall remain firm for the entire 
bid period. 
 

5.2 At the end of the initial one year bid period, upon mutual agreement of the County and the 
Contractor, the agreement may be renewed for two (2) additional years, in two (2) 
consecutive one-year intervals.  Renewal of multiple item bid awards shall be contingent 
upon renewal of all items; partial renewals shall not be accepted by the County. 

 
SECTION 6:  BID SECURITY 
 

6.1 There will be no bid security requested for this bid. 
 
SECTION 7:  QUALIFICATION OF BIDDER 
 

7.1 No formal written Bidder Qualification questionnaire is being requested for this bid. 
 
7.2 All bidders shall submit the Vendor Responsibility Questionnaire (Attachment “C”) as part of 

the bid. 
 
7.3 In addition, Albany County may make such investigations it deems necessary to determine 

the ability of the Bidder to perform the work.  The bidder shall furnish to the County, within 
five (5) days of a request, all such information and data for this purpose as may be requested.  
The County reserves the right to reject any bid if the information submitted by, or investigation 
of, a bidder fails to satisfy the County that such bidder is properly qualified to carry out the  
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County of Albany 
Request for Bids #2020-121 

Law Enforcement Equipment and Supplies 
 

Various Albany County Facilities 
 

Specifications 
 

1. Through this Request for Bids, the County of Albany seeks qualified and responsive 
vendors to provide law enforcement and safety equipment and supplies of various types 
and quantities.  Items to be purchased from this contract may include, but are not limited 
to:  tactical items; duty gear; uniform accessories; fire/rescue items; personal safety items; 
first aid items; forensic and evidence collection supplies; and chemical law enforcement 
devices. 
 

2. Awards made under this bid are intended to be extended for use by any political 
subdivisions in the state of New York. 

 
3. Section A represents items of unknown type and quantity, which the County or other 

eligible agencies will purchase throughout the bid term.  Pricing is requested as a discount 
from the bidder’s catalog, website or published price list.  Separate categories are provided 
in this section for “General Line” law enforcement/ safety supplies and for Forensic 
supplies.   
 
In Section A, Bidders are to quote a percentage discount from any or all of the 
following: 

 
a. Bidder’s general catalog which is current at the time of purchase. 

Bidder shall furnish a copy of the current catalog with the bid submission.  
Additional copies of hard copy catalogs must be supplied at the County’s request 
throughout the term of the bid at no cost to the County.  Updated catalogs shall be 
automatically supplied to the County at no additional cost during the bid term. 
 

b. Bidder’s website or online store. 
Bidder shall indicate the website address on the bid form. 
 

c. Bidder’s published price list which is current at the time of purchase. 
If bidding discount from list price, bidder shall furnish a current price list on CD-
ROM with the bid submission.  Additional copies of the price list shall be furnished 
to the County upon request at no additional cost during the bid term Price list shall 
remain firm for the initial term of the bid, and may be updated upon renewal of the 
bid.  
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4. For items in Section A, the following terms and conditions shall apply: 
 

a. Catalog, web, or list price, less the discount, shall be net price, and shall be F.O.B. 
destination, freight prepaid and allowed to any location in New York State. No 
additional costs for shipping or delivery will be allowed, with the exception of 
extremely large or overweight items (e.g., safes).  Any such exceptions shall be 
noted by bidder with the bid submission. 

 
b. No minimum order requirements shall apply. 

 
5. Purchases of items in Section A will be made as follows: 
 

a. At time of purchase, if specific items to be ordered are available from multiple 
awarded bidders under Section A, the Albany County Purchasing Division will fax 
or email a price inquiry to all awarded Section A Bidders of the appropriate 
category (General Line or Forensic). 

 
b. Bidder’s price quotes shall be returned by fax or email to the Purchasing Division 

within (1) business day of the request, unless otherwise specified on the price 
inquiry. 

 
c. Bidder’s price quote shall specify base bid (catalog or list) price and net 

(discounted) price. 
 

d. Award will be made to the Section A awarded bidder offering the best net price to 
the County for a particular order. 

 
6. Section B represents items in the category of chemical law enforcement devices, which the 

County or other eligible agencies will purchase throughout the bid term.  For Section B, 
Bidders are to quote a percentage discount from the manufacturers or other specified 
price list, including a copy of all referenced price lists with the bid submission.   
 

a. Additional space is provided on the bid form for bidders to write in additional 
product lines, not otherwise specified in the bid, which they wish to offer under 
a contracted discount pricing structure. 

 
7. For items in Section B, the following terms and conditions shall apply: 
 

a. List price, less the discount, shall be net price, and shall be F.O.B. destination, 
freight prepaid and allowed to any location in New York State. No additional costs 
for shipping or delivery will be allowed. 
 

b. The minimum order for chemical law enforcement devices shall be one (1) 
full case of product.   
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c. Only official price list updates released by the manufacturer will be considered by 
Albany County throughout the bid term and upon renewal.  Bidder shall submit any 
request to update its awarded price lists to the Albany County Purchasing Agent, 
along with the official manufacturer’s updated price list.  Bidder shall furnish 
additional supporting documentation as requested by the County.  

 
8. Awarded Bidders may utilize authorized distributors for processing of orders.  Bidders who 

wish to do so shall return the Authorized Distributor Form with the bid submission, 
identifying Authorized Distributor’s name, contact information, federal employer 
identification number; what product line(s) they will distribute; how purchase orders and 
payments are to be directed.   
 
Authorized distributors shall at all times during the bid period honor the awarded bid 
pricing and terms. 
 

9. All discount(s) offered for Sections A and Section B shall be the minimum discount(s) 
offered to the County and any eligible agencies at any time during the term of the bid.   
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COUNTY OF ALBANY
RFB #2020-121    LAW ENFORCEMENT AND EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

SECTION A:  DISCOUNT

Vendors  Atlantic Tactical  Galls LLC  Lynn Peavy Corp. 
 Prendo Forensics, 

LLC  Sirchi Forensics  Safariland LLC 
 United Uniform 

Distrobution  
New York Police 

Supply

Discount Offered from 
Bidder's General Line 
Law Enforcement  
Online or Published 
Catalog or Published 
Price List 6% 15% off MSRP 5% 12% 15% No Bid for Section A 6.0%

No bid for 
Section A

Catalog or price list 
from which discount 
will be calculated 
(hard copy catalog, 
online catalog, vendor 
price list):

www.atlantictactic
al.com

 www.galls.com - Not 
including sale/ 
clearance items. Also 
no discount on Bullard 
or Streamlight items. 
Free shipping except on 
oversized or hazmat 

https://lynnpeave
y.com/?v=dfd44c
c06c1b

http://prendoforen
sics.com/ www.sirchie.com

www.unitedunif
orm.com

Discount Offered from 
Bidder's Forensic 
Supply  Online or 
Published Catalog or 
Published Price List No bid No bid 5% 12% 15% No Bid 6.0%
Catalog or price list 
from which discount 
will be calculated 
(hard copy catalog, 
online catalog, vendor 
price list): ONLINE ONLINE

https://lynnpeave
y.com/?v=dfd44c
c06c1b

http://prendoforen
sics.com/ http://www.sirchie.co

Agency Price List 
(supplied)

http://www.unite
duniform.com/

Distritutors? N N N N N Y Y

Notes
*Price lists also 
in bid folder

*Price lists also in 
bid folder

*Price lists also in 
bid folder

*Price lists also in 
bid folder

*This discount 
excludes: Vehicles, 

drying & fuming 
cabinets/ work 
stations, RUVIS 

Equipment, body 
cameras and digital 

forensics *Authorized Distributors:

**Price list also in bid foldAtlantic Tactical
United Uniforms

Highlighted areas indicate award is being made 

http://www.atlantictactical.com/
http://www.atlantictactical.com/
https://lynnpeavey.com/?v=dfd44cc06c1b
https://lynnpeavey.com/?v=dfd44cc06c1b
https://lynnpeavey.com/?v=dfd44cc06c1b
http://prendoforensics.com/
http://prendoforensics.com/
http://www.sirchie.com/
http://www.uniteduniform.com/
http://www.uniteduniform.com/
https://lynnpeavey.com/?v=dfd44cc06c1b
https://lynnpeavey.com/?v=dfd44cc06c1b
https://lynnpeavey.com/?v=dfd44cc06c1b
http://prendoforensics.com/
http://prendoforensics.com/
http://www.sirchie.com/
http://www.uniteduniform.com/
http://www.uniteduniform.com/
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COUNTY OF ALBANY
RFB #2020-121  LAW ENFORCEMENT  EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

SECTION B:  CHEMICAL LAW ENFORCEMENT DEVICES

% Discount from 
Price List

Catalog/ Price 
List 

Identification

Incl. 
Price 
List

Date of 
Price List

Delivery Lead 
Time (Days 

ARO)

% Discount 
from Price 

List

Catalog/ Price 
List 

Identification
Incl. 

Price List
Date of 

Price List

Delivery 
Lead Time 

(Days ARO)

% Discount 
from Price 

List

Catalog/ Price 
List 

Identification

Incl. Price 
List

Date of 
Price List

Delivery 
Lead Time 

(Days ARO)

A.
Combined Tactical 
Systems- Penn Arms 20% Agency List 3/2/2020 30-45 Days

B.

Defense Technology 
Corporation of 
America 5%

Defense Tech. 
Agency List 6/1/2020 60 days ARO

C. Aerko International 5% Aerko 2020 1/1/2020 30 days

Security Equipment 
Corp./Sabre 10% SABRE 2020 1/2/2020 30 DAYS *Authorized Distributors:

Atlantic Tactical
United Uniforms

Highlighted areas indicate award is being made 

United Uniform Dist. LLC* Safariland LLC New York Police Supply
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